
Elders – Here to serve you 
Ken Treybig, Pastor – (903) 844-9246 Frank McCrady – (903) 845-6882 
Les McCullough – (903) 636-5585 Melton McNeely – (903) 769-3394 
Leroy Neff – (903) 636-5248 John Trotter – (903) 636-4515 
Leon Walker – (903) 636-4928 

 
 
 
 
 
 
East Texas: The Broadway, 
Tyler – 2:30 PM 
Song Leader – Ed Weiss 
Pianist – Ardith Weiss 
Sermonette – Preston Buchanan 
Sermon – Video 
 
Ruston: Holiday Inn Express, 
Ruston – 1 PM 
Song Leader – Steve Barnette 
Pianist – Johna Barnette 
Sermonette – Gordon McCarty 
Sermon – Ken Treybig 
 
General Announcements 
Snacks 

Kindly give the ladies about 
10 minutes after services before 
lining up for refreshments. This 
will give the servers time 
to prepare the table with food, 
utensils, etc. We appreciate 
your cooperation! 

Please also allow the children 
in Sabbath School to go through 
the line with a parent first so 
class can begin promptly. 
 
Sabbath School 

Sabbath School will begin as 
soon as the children have gotten 
a snack. Please come down to 
the second floor meeting room. 
We will meet every Sabbath 
this month except September 
29. 

 
Excused Absence Forms 

If you need an excused ab-
sence form for work or school, 
please sign the list on the In-
formation Table (one name per 
line, please) and we will pre-
pare them to distribute the fol-
lowing Sabbath. 

 
Volleyball Practice 

We will have volleyball prac-
tice tomorrow, Sunday, from 9-
11 AM and will be held at the 
Big Sandy Middle School Gym. 
You can check the calendar on 
the www.cogwaet.org website 
for other practice dates. 

 
Feast of Trumpets 

East Texas will meet at 
Maude Cobb Convention Cen-
ter in Longview. Ruston will 
meet at the Holiday Inn Express 
in Ruston. Services are at 10:30 
AM and 2:30 PM. 

 
Holy Day Offerings 

Blue Holy Day offering enve-
lopes are available on the In-
formation Table. Please pick up 
four for the Fall Holy Days as 
these envelopes make donation 
processing much easier. Be sure 
to put your name and address 
on the front of the envelope as 
well as your Donor Envelope 
Number below the date in the 
space provided. It can be found 
on your 2011 year-end receipt. 

Checks should be made paya-
ble to COG-East Texas, as we 
will process the offering locally 
before sending the funds to 
headquarters. Please do not in-
clude other items (tithes, notes, 
etc.) as that greatly complicates 
the local processing. 

 
Men’s Leadership Club 

Our next meeting will be next 
Sabbath, September 22, at 5 
PM. 

 
Hard of Hearing Assistance 

We recently purchased a 
transmitter to help those with 
hearing difficulties. It transmits 
on the standard frequency used 
at the Feast, so if you have a 
headset you’re welcome to 
bring it. 

 
Feast Activity Information 

Activity schedules and de-
scriptions for our U.S. Feast of 
Tabernacles sites are currently 
posted at http://feast.cogwa.org. 
Please be sure to check out the 
activities at the site you will be 
attending as soon as possible. In 
some cases there are early 
commitments or tickets that 
must be purchased in advance 
of the Feast and deadlines are 
coming up soon. Thank you for 
your help in this regard. Some 
sites continue to add activity 
information; therefore, you will 
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want to keep an eye on your 
specific Feast site to see what is 
being planned. 

 
Kerrville Feast Information 

Sabbath services WILL be 
held on September 29th at 3 PM 
at the Inn of the Hills in the 
Bluebonnet Room. Please bring 
your hymnals for this service. 
We are planning to project 
hymns during the Feast. 

We do request registration 
and prepay for some activities. 
All this is available at 
the Kerrville Site Descrip-
tion page. 

 
Teen Garage Sale 

Hoard no more! Save the 
dates of November 1 & 2 for 
the Teen Garage Sale fundraiser 
at the Vital Earth facility on 
Hwy. 80 in Gladewater. After 
the Feast we’ll announce more 
details concerning dropping off 
donated items. If you have any 
questions, please contact Ro-
chelle Boyce. Thank you in ad-
vance for supporting the teen 
fundraiser. Proceeds go toward 
offsetting the costs for the teens 
to attend Winter Family Week-
end in December in Louisville, 
Kentucky.   

 


