
Elders – Here to serve you 
Ken Treybig, Pastor – (903) 844-9246 Scott Hammer – (903) 845-5189 
Frank McCrady – (903) 845-6882 Les McCullough – (903) 636-5585  
Melton McNeely – (903) 769-3394 Leroy Neff – (903) 636-5248  
John Trotter – (903) 636-4515 Leon Walker – (903) 636-4928 

 
 
 
 
 
 
East Texas: 708 E Broadway, 
Gladewater – 2:30 p.m. 
Song Leader – Ed Weiss 
Pianist – Ardith Weiss 
Sermonette – John Flynn 
Sermon – Melton McNeely 
 
Ruston: Holiday Inn Express, 
Ruston – 12 noon 
Song Leader – John Ivey 
Pianist – Vicky Morton 
Split Sermon – Ken Treybig 
Bible Study – Ken Treybig 
 
General Announcements 
Ruston Bible Study 

Ruston will meet at 12 noon 
today for a shorter service. That 
will be followed by a light pot-
luck lunch and a Bible Study. 
 
Sabbath School 

We will have Sabbath School 
this week. Please get a snack 
and come to the classroom after 
services. 

 
Local Directory 

Information sheets were 
passed out last Sabbath. Please 
complete yours and give to Mr. 
John Trotter today in East Tex-
as and Betty Brooks in Ruston. 

 
Feast Registration 
You can still register for the 
Feast by accessing the 
http://feast.cogwa.org/ web 
page. Of course, anyone who 

does not have access to the In-
ternet can be assisted by our 
local festival advisers—Eric 
Case in East Texas and Chris 
Teague in Ruston. As a remind-
er, registration ends at 11 p.m. 
Central Daylight Time on 
Tuesday, May 6. 
 
Early Feast Housing 

Those who qualify to make 
early housing reservations can 
begin doing so on Tuesday, 
May 6. Members who qualify to 
make early reservations include: 

1. Those who need handi-
capped rooms. 

2. Those with very limited 
finances who need to be assured 
of procuring one of the lower-
priced rooms. 

3. Those who, due to dietary 
requirements, must have a 
kitchenette. 

4. Those who have a large 
immediate family (six or more). 
If you fit into one of these cate-
gories, please check with our 
Feast adviser about whether you 
need a password. 

A password is needed at some 
sites to procure early reserva-
tions. Our Feast adviser will be 
happy to assist you in finding 
satisfactory housing. 

 
Second Passover 

Please be sure to contact Mr. 
Treybig if you need to take the 

second Passover on Tuesday 
night, May 13, at sundown. 

 
Midweek Bible Study 

We will have a midweek Bi-
ble Study and finger foods 
lunch Wednesday, May 14, at 
11 a.m. at the Gladewater Hall. 
The date was moved back one 
week from the previous plans. 

 
“Friday Night Live” 

The next “Friday Night Live” 
Bible study will be Friday, May 
16. To connect, go to 
http://members.cogwa.org/fnl/. 

 
Men’s Leadership Club 

Our final meeting of Men’s 
Leadership Club will be May 
17, about an hour after services 
at the Gladewater hall. It will be 
our Ladies’ Night and we look 
forward to our special guests. If 
you are not involved in the club 
meeting we ask that you remove 
your belongings by that time to 
allow them to set up for the club 
meeting in the front of the hall. 
 
Camp Registration 

Online registration is availa-
ble at http://camps.cogwa.org. 
Preteen, teen and Challenger 
applications can be submitted 
there, and details about each 
camp (including the registration 
deadline) are on that website. 
Deadlines vary by camp, so be 
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sure to pay attention to the 
dates. 


