
Elders – Here to serve you 
Ken Treybig, Pastor – (903) 844-9246 Scott Hammer – (903) 845-5189 
Les McCullough – (903) 636-5585 Melton McNeely – (903) 769-3394 
John Trotter – (903) 636-4515 Leon Walker – (903) 636-4928 

 
 
 
 
 
 
East Texas: 24345 County Rd 
3107, Gladewater – 2:30 p.m. 
Song Leader – Wynn Worthen 
Pianist – Ardith Weiss 
Sermonette – Rod Gehrke 
Sermon – Ralph Levy 
 
Ruston: Holiday Inn Express, 
Ruston – 12 noon 
Song Leader – Steve Barnette 
Pianist – Johna Barnette 
Split Sermon – Ken Treybig 
Bible Study – Ken Treybig 
 
General Announcements 
Camps 

Camp Wood Lake (preteen) 
ran this week and went well. 
Camp Sequoia will run next 
week followed by Camp Strong 
Rock beginning on Sunday, Ju-
ly 31. Your prayers for God’s 
continued protection and bless-
ing would be appreciated. 
 
FOI - Embark 

Foundation Outreach Interna-
tional’s new Embark program 
is ready for your participation. 

We have an opportunity for all 
young people in their first ca-
reer or those about to start their 
careers from college, trade 
school or high school—who 
want a personal travel guide to 
take them on seven journeys of 
travel to explore a world of ide-
as and advice built just for 
them— from thought leaders 
and cool programs at top uni-

versities, corporations, business 
consultants and life coaches—
through a totally free program 
of awesome personalized suc-
cess training for work, family 
and life. 

But Embark is missing some-
thing … YOU! 

· Would you like to get a head 
start on skills that can benefit 
you for the rest of your life? 

· Would you like to explore 
which jobs and careers fit you? 

· Would you like to be per-
sonally advised by a person 
with years of work experience? 

· Would you like to avoid un-
necessary bumps in the road? 

· And would you like to ex-
plore your world of opportuni-
ties? 

Then join us for seven jour-
neys that will change your life 
by signing up for Embark. 

To sign up, go to 
www.embarkprogram.org and 
complete a Traveler applica-
tion online. 

 
Kenya FOI Project 

Greetings from Allen, Texas! 
Foundation Outreach Interna-

tional and the Church would 
like to announce an opportunity 
for up to four young adults to 
serve in Kenya at the youth 
camp in mid-December 2016. 
The camp is a weeklong youth 
camp with a potential safari trip 

to a Kenyan game park after 
camp. 

We recommend you visit the 
FOI website (accessible from 
the COGWA member website) 
if you are interested in this 
unique service project, and 
please pick up copies of both 
the project fact sheet (which 
details requirements, dates and 
costs) and the application. The 
deadline for applying is Aug. 
31; however, the SOONER you 
apply the better, as we will be 
accepting people during the 
process! So, get your applica-
tion in soon! 

For those few who may have 
ALREADY completed a PRE-
LIMINARY INTEREST form 
from the FOI website—be sure 
to complete the application as 
well, available online or at the 
Information Table. 

If you have any questions, 
feel free to contact Tim Waddle 
at tim.waddle@cogwa.org. 

Thank you all very much and 
karibu sana! 

 
Prayer Requests/Updates 

Wanda Klepfer has an alter-
nate heart stress test scheduled 
for next Monday. She would 
appreciate prayers that it goes 
well so she will not need a heart 
catherization before being ap-
proved for a knee transplant. 

Grace Disman would like to 
thank everyone for their prayers 
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and expressions of concern. The 
adjustments to the pacemaker 
have done well and she begins 
therapy on Monday. 


